
From: Lisa Ellsworth lisa.h.ellsworth@gmail.com
Subject: Re: Bowman order

Date: January 23, 2018 at 7:48 AM
To: Robert Tavilla rob@triconsports.com
Cc: Courtney and Brendan Jones donovanmom@gmail.com

Hi Rob,

Excellent.  I’m attaching an Excel spreadsheet with our shirt size totals.  We’d like to order a total of 144 shirts and would love 
them broken up by class.  There are 5 classes.  And then could the staff shirts can be bundled together (20 shirts) and the extra 
shirts (13 shirts) be bundled together?  That would be super helpful.

We would like to do 2 colors on the front AND the back (gold and white).  We’d also like the front design on the left chest area.  
I’m thinking 4” may be a bit too large, so we look forward to seeing what your designers think.  I’m attaching the artwork for the 
front design.

Please let us know if you have any questions.  In the meantime, we’ll figure out how to retrieve funds from the PTA.

Thanks so much,
Courtney and Lisa

On Jan 21, 2018, at 9:23 PM, Robert Tavilla <rob@triconsports.com> wrote:

Hi you can just email me the totals (spreadsheet is fine) and again if you want 
these broken down by class just let me know.    We will email you an invoice, 
you can pay online via a Credit card or bank transfer or you can submit for a 
check so you have it at time of pickup. Confirm the logo colors and locations if 
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check so you have it at time of pickup. Confirm the logo colors and locations if 
you could, I know we had talked about a left chest vs center chest and if you 
wanted the front to be 1 or 2 inks

Thanks
Rob
 
Robert Tavilla

Tricon Sports Inc
415 Waltham St
Lexington MA 02421
781.861.8921 x11

From: Courtney Jones <donovanmom@gmail.com>
To: Robert Tavilla <rob@triconsportsinc.com> 
Cc: Lisa Ellsworth <lisa.h.ellsworth@gmail.com>
Sent: Sunday, January 21, 2018 8:18 PM
Subject: Bowman order

Hi Rob, 
We are ready to order.  Finally!  How should we submit the final numbers?  Also, how 
do we pay Tricon?
Thanks! 
Courtney 


